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Freedom of Information Request 
 
Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request. 
 
Request / Response: 
 
1. How many patients within your CCG were deemed eligible for NHS Continuing 

Healthcare packages in the financial years 2016/17, 2015/16 and 2014/15? 
Please could I have this information broken down by year? 
 

This information is freely available in the public domain and can be accessed via the 
following links:  
 
2014/15: 
 
Qtr1&Qtr2 (Apr14 – Sep14)  - https://digital.nhs.uk/catalogue/PUB16265 
 
Qtr 3 (Oct14 - Dec14)  - https://digital.nhs.uk/catalogue/PUB17107 
 
Qtr4 (Jan14 - Mar15) - https://digital.nhs.uk/catalogue/PUB17693 
 
  
 
2015/16: 
  
 
Qtr1 (Apr15-Jun15) - https://digital.nhs.uk/catalogue/PUB18354 
 
Qtr2 (Jul15 - Sep15) - https://digital.nhs.uk/catalogue/PUB19312 
 
Qtr3  (Oct15 - Dec15)  - https://digital.nhs.uk/catalogue/PUB20229 
 

mailto:knowsley.ccgcommunications@knowsley.nhs.uk


Chair: Dr Andrew Pryce Chief Executive: Dianne Johnson 

Knowsley.CCGCommunications@knowsley.nhs.uk 

 

Qtr4 15/16 (Jan16 - Mar16) - http://content.digital.nhs.uk/catalogue/PUB20890 
 
  
 
2016/17:  
 
Q1 16/17 (Apr16-Jun16) - http://content.digital.nhs.uk/catalogue/PUB21579 
 
Q2 16/17 (Jul16-Sep16) - http://www.content.digital.nhs.uk/catalogue/PUB23155 
 
Q3 16/17 (Oct16-Dec16) - http://www.content.digital.nhs.uk/catalogue/PUB23868 
 
Q4 16/17 (Jan17-Mar17) - http://digital.nhs.uk/catalogue/PUB30018 
 
 

2. How many patients within your CCG died in hospital while awaiting the start of 
a NHS Continuing Healthcare care and support package in the financial years 
2016/17, 2015/16 and 2014/15? Please could I have this information broken 
down by year? 

The CCG is not able to provide this information because this specific information is 
not recorded on our current CHC and FNC database.  
 
3. How many patients in the last four financial years have waited more than 

a) one week 
b) one month 
c) one year to receive a care and support package after being found eligible 
for NHS Continuing Healthcare? Please could I have this information broken 
down by year? 

The CCG is not able to provide this information because this specific information is 
not recorded on our current CHC and FNC database. 
 
4. What was the longest wait between a patient being found eligible for NHS 

Continuing Healthcare and receiving a care and support package in the financial 
years 2016/17, 2015/16 and 2014/15? Please could I have this information 
broken down by year? 

The CCG is not able to provide this information because this specific information is 
not recorded on our current CHC and FNC database. 
 


